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Three classic Kenneth C. Davis audiobooks are now available as an
audiobook collection. Collection includes: Don't Know Much About

the Civil War, Don't Know Much About History, Anniversary
Edition, and Don't Know Much About Anything Don't Know Much
About the Civil War (5 CDs, Abridged):Millions of Americans,
bored by dull textbooks, are in the dark about the most significant
event in our history. Now New York Times bestselling author

Kenneth C. Davis comes to the rescue, deftly sorting out the players,
the politics, and the key events-Emancipation and Reconstruction,
Shiloh and Gettysburg, Generals Grant and Lee, Harriet Beecher
Stowe-and much more.Drawing on moving eyewitness accounts,

Davis includes a wealth of "hidden history" about the roles played by
women and African Americans before and during the war, along
with lesser-known facts that will enthrall even learned Civil War
buffs. Vivid, informative, and hugely entertaining, Don't Know

Much About the Civil War is the only audiobook you'll ever need on
"the war that never ended." Don't Know Much About History,
Anniversary Edition (5 CDs, Abridged):Here, celebrating the

twentieth anniversary of its debut as a New York Times bestseller, is
the revised, updated, and expanded edition of the classic anti-

textbook that changed the way we look at history. First published
two decades ago, when the "closing of the American mind" was in
the headlines, Don't Know Much About History proved Americans
don't hate history-just the dull version that was dished out in school.
Now Davis has brought his groundbreaking work up to the present,
including the history of an "Era of Broken Trust," from the end of
the Clinton administration through the recent Great Recession. This
additional material covers the horrific events of 9/11 and the rise of
conspiracy theorists, the wars in Iraq and Afghanistan, Hurricane



Katrina and the failure of the New Orleans levees, the global
financial meltdown, the election of Barack Obama, and the national

controversy of same-sex marriage. Don't Know Much About
Anything (4 CDs, Abridged):Don't Know Much About Anything:
Everything You Need to Know But Never Learned About Famous
People, Exceptional Places, Historical Happenings, Holidays and

Traditions, Everyday Objects, Remarkable Inventions, Space, Sports,
Food, Entertainment and More! is a compendium of around 275
columns, sorted into the subject categories listed in the subtitle.

Quizzes on the atomic bomb, hamburgers, football, andThe Wizard
of Oz are included, along with the Emancipation Proclamation, cold
weather, and Mother Theresa, to name a few.Like all of Ken Davis'
Don't Know Much About audiobooks, Don't Know Much About
Anything will educate and inform listeners while allowing them to

have fun.
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